INVITATION TO BID

Sealed Bids are hereby invited by the Parish of Caddo for
Uniforms, Professional

A pre-bid conference will be held at 10:00 a.m., Thursday, June 26, 2008, Government Plaza, 505
th
Travis Street, 8 floor Conference Room, Shreveport, LA 71101.

Complete Documents may be obtained, without charge, from the Purchasing Division, Parish of
Caddo, Government Plaza, 505 Travis Street, Suite 850, Shreveport, Louisiana 71101. Bids shall be
submitted on an official proposal form furnished with the bid package. No bid submitted in any
other form would be considered or accepted. The bid shall be submitted in an envelope clearly
marked as:

Bid No.: 08-08, Uniforms, Professional
Bids will be received no later than 3:00 p.m., on July 3, 2008, by the Purchasing Division, Parish of
Caddo, Government Plaza, 505 Travis Street, Suite 850, Shreveport, Louisiana 71101. No bid shall

be received after this date and time. All bids will be publicly opened and read aloud by the Parish
Administrator or a designated representative at the above stated date and time.

The Parish of Caddo reserves the right to reject, in whole or in part, any and all bids and to waive any
and all technicalities and informalities in accordance with the state law.

The Parish of Caddo is an Equal Opportunity Employer.

John G. Adger, CPPO, CPPB
Purchasing Manager

Caddo Citizen: June 12 & 19, 2008



Bid Title: Uniforms, Professional

Bid No.: 08-08

BID TABULATION

Vendor

Group 1
Enforcement Uniforms

Group 11
Paolo Shirts

Group HI
Serubs Pants and Shirts

Group 1V
Durable Work Attire

Ranchland Uniforms

# 27150.00

£3.051.50

£2.133.25

£38,349.25

Cindy’s Scrubs & Swil

o Rl

No Bidl

% 9,105.25

No Bid

Fruit of the Loom

No Did

No Bid

No Did

No Bid

Alsco, Inc.

%5 141,50

Z 4 480.25

£ 0015

£43,253.40

Aramark Unilorm Services

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Ridl

The Uniform Place

fio Bid

No Bid

ﬁoo 1,85

No Bid
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PARISH OF CADDO
Purchasing Division

Bud Title: Uniforms, Professional

Bid No.- 0B-08
Group |
Ranchland Alsco
Line ftam  Quantity Unit Price  Ex Price Unit Price  Ext Prics
211 20 324,00 480.00 $25.50 $510.00
212 20 26.50 530.00 28.00 560,00
213 10 26.50 285.00 30.50 305.00
214 20 22.00 440.00 3475 885.00
215 30 27.00 B10.00 37.30 1118.00
218 50 1.50 75.00 1.50 75.00
217 B .00 o.o0 0.50 2300
218 150 1.00 150.00 335 502.50
$2,750.00 $3,781.50
Group i
Ranchiand Alsco
221 12 519.00 S2285.00 518.00 $216.00
222 12 12.00 144.00 18.00 21600
223 50 10.00 500.00 13.00 650.00
224 5 21.00 105.00 17.80 B89.50
225 a3 1575 1.543.50 15,00 1,470.00
226 53 1.00 531.00 3.35 1,778.85
53.051.50 5442035
Group Il
Ranchland Alsco Cindy’s Scrubs & Stufi The Uniform Place
Line ftern  Quandity Unil Price  Exd_Price Unit Pricg  Ex), Price Unit Price  Ext, Price Linit Price  Ext Price
231 28 $14.00 $364.00 $13.50 $351.00 51325 534450 51320 534330
232 13 15.50 201.50 15.00 185.00 1575 204.75 14.53 188.80
223 13 15.50 201.50 15.15 185.85 21.00 273.00 14.53 188.8%
234 5 14.00 70.00 13.50 67.50 12.40 62.00 1320 88.00
235 13 16.00 208.00 14.70 151.10 14.25 18525 15.13 186.69
238 3 1275 3E25 11.85 3555 12.00 35.00 11.83 3578
237 18 12,75 228.50 11.85 21330 12.00 21800 1183 21474
2338 21 14.00 284.00 13,35 28035 14.50 304.50 13.27 276.67
233 B 17.00 10200 16.35 83.10 1575 2450 17.00 102.00
2310 12 14.00 168.00 13.50 162.00 13.25 159.00 15.00 156.00
21N 3 13.50 40.50 10.95 3285 12.75 3825 11.32 33.69
2312 1" 15.00 165.00 13.85 153.45 12.75 140.25 14.00 154 00
2313 3 17.00 51.00 15.00 45.00 1575 47.25 14,33 4259
5213325 5202215 5210525 52.001.85
Group IV
Ranchiand Alsco
Line tem  Quantily Unlt Price  Ext, Price Unit Brice  Exi. Price
241 288 514,50 5412050 $1475 3428275
242 137 15.50 2123.50 12,50 171250
243 ] 19.00 114.00 20,00 120.00
244 83 16.50 1,368.50 14.00 1,162.00
245 ] 19.00 114.00 20.00 120.00
248 15 16.00 24000 17.75 266.25
247 8 16.00 14400 17.75 159.75
2458 ] 15.00 144 00 17.75 158.75
243 2 18.50 37.00 18.50 30.00
2410 18 16.50 33300 19.50 351.00
241 25 17.00 425.00 14.25 356.25
2412 25 2000 50000 15.00 375.00
2413 408 14.25 581400 14.25 581400
2414 93 875 813.75 13.75 127875
2415 5 25.00 130.00 171.75 Ba.75
2418 12 15.50 185.00 15.00 1E0.00
2417 287 17.00 4,538,00 1525 407175
2418 110 18.50 234500 17.25 1.897.50
2413 2 16 50 3300 13.00 25.00
2420 4 19.00 76.00 13.00 52.00
2421 524 1.15 4.061.00 775 405100
2422 1 2550 291.50 25,50 280,50
2423 B 12.75 102.00 12.00 25.00
24324 100 2200 2.200.00 2050 205000
24325 1 52.00 52.00 40.00 40.00
2426 20 47.00 230.00 4000 BOG.0D
2427 20 38.50 T70.00 39.00 T80.00
2428 15 38.00 585.00 36.00 540.00
2428 1 13.00 13.00 11.50 11.50
2430 -] 1275 102.00 12.00 55.00
2431 983 150 1.489.50 150  1.489.50
24.32 983 0.00 0.00 0.50 485.50
2433 2978 1.00 2,979.00 3.35 9.679.85
2434 524 250 1.310.00 125 B55.00
$38,386.25 $43 B58 85

| certify y of bids recelved an 07/14/08.

G, Adger CFPD, CPPB
asing Manager




	08-08IT.pdf
	08-08, uniforms, professional bid tabulation

